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FEAST
GIARDINA’S RESTAURANT & BAR

Giardina’s welcomes you to a warm Southern 
dining experience served Delta-casual style. 
Enjoy a classic cocktail in our bar, then dine 

in our spacious dining room, or secluded 
away in one of our cozy private booths. From 
steaks and seafood to housemade pastas and 
desserts, this is one feast that will leave you 

hungry for more.

EXPERIENCE

Elevate your visit to Greenwood with a Viking 
culinary experience. We offer classes and 
packages designed especially for Alluvian 
guests that are suited for cooking and food 

enthusiasts of all ages and interests. 



SOUTHERN
MODERN. LUXURIOUS.

With your first step into our gleaming  
marble-floored lobby, you’ll notice something 

special. It’s the warmth of Southern charm 
coupled with exquisite modern luxury. The 
Alluvian Hotel offers beautiful guestrooms, 

plenty of meeting spaces, a quaint courtyard, 
and premium guest services. 

REST 
GUEST ROOMS & SUITES

Both refined and intimate, The Alluvian Hotel 
offers 50 beautiful guestrooms, including 5 

suites. Each room features custom furnishings 
in colors and textures reflective of Delta earth, 
foliage, and sky. Here you can sink in to all that 

makes us Delta proud.

GATHER 
EVENT & MEETING SPACE

We have the perfect space for your next 
meeting or social event. Whether a business 

meeting, wedding, corporate retreat, or cocktail 
party, The Alluvian Hotel mixes unmatched 

charm & ambience with outstanding gourmet 
catering. Allow us the pleasure of customizing 

your event to meet any and all of your  
unique needs.

REJUVENATE 
THE ALLUVIAN SPA

Pamper yourself head to toe at our luxurious 
full-service spa. Choose from our complete 

menu of treatments including face and body 
care, massage therapy, therapeutic baths, hand 
and foot care, and cosmetic and hair services. 
Studio A offers yoga classes and workshops 

for those seeking a connection between body, 
heart and mind.


